
Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item ACCO Buckeye Clayton Paper & Distribution Inc. Hillyard
Industrial 

Soap
Interboro 

Packaging Corp.
Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Staples Unipak

Vendor Accepted 
Bid

Vendor Accepted $

Chemical 0

A-01
Take Down Fresh 

& Clean
Gal Hillyard HIL0046806 NO NO 40

$21.03 - 
Scenturion - 

54351000
$29.09 Hillyard $29.09

A-02 Take Down Cherry Case Hillyard HIL0046604 NO NO 12
$84.12 - 

Scenturion - 
54351000

$130.89 Hillyard $130.89

A-04
Easy fresh cover 
cotton Blossom

Case Renown REN03068-FR YES YES 20 $64.98 Buckeye $64.98

A-05
Clorox 360 

Chemical, Clorox 
total 360

Case NO NO 24 $43.18 $71.85 $40.89 $88.84 Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $40.89

A-06 Restroom Cleaner Case Comet NO NO 100 $38.28 - Sanicare 
DRC $73.24 $54.99 $54.23 Staples $54.23

A-07
PH Neutral Floor 

Cleaner
5 Gal Top Clean  YES YES 12 $47.75 $36.12 Hillyard $36.12

A-08
Eco Floor clean 

E33
5 Gal Buckeye 60331400 NO NO 110 $95.60 Buckeye $95.60

Concentrated Dispenser Chemicals and unit

B-01 Carpet Spotter Case YES YES 10 $67.20 $90.89 $29.99 Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $29.99

B-02 Carpet Pre-Spray Case Hillyard HIL0081425 NO NO 40 $73.48 $93.32 Hillyard $93.32

B-03 Carpet pre spray Case YES YES 34 $73.48 $30.25 $38.79
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$30.25

B-04
Encapsulating 
carpet cleaner

Case YES YES 22 $48.50 $49.20 Buckeye $48.50

B-05 Neutralizer Case Hillyard HIL0081825 NO NO 44 $117.17 Hillyard $117.17
B-06 Recoat Prep Case Hillyard HIL0083425 NO NO 12 $123.84 $88.36 Hillyard $88.36

B-07 Spray Clean HD Case Hillyard HIL0182025 NO NO 30
$79.88 - E12 Glass 

Clenaer - 
60121400

$186.99 Hillyard $186.99

B-08 Super Shine-All Case Hillyard HIL0080825 NO NO 54 $95.60 $90.15 Hillyard $90.15
B-09 Suprox Case Hillyard HIL0083825 NO NO 100 $90.04 $82.85 Hillyard $82.85

B-10
Eco Hydrogen 

Cleaner
Case Buckeye 60151400 NO NO 100 $90.04 Buckeye $90.04

B-12 Top Clean Case Hillyard HIL0081025 NO NO 100

$95.60 - E33 
Neutral Floor 

Cleaner - 
60331400

$108.07 Hillyard $108.07

B-13 Windo-Clean Case Hillyard HIL0080225 NO NO 50
$79.88 - E12 Glass 

Cleaner - 
60121400

$101.73 Hillyard $101.73

B-14
Q.T. Plus Arsenal 

24
Case Hillyard HIL0082425 NO NO 2 $189.16 $86.89 Hillyard $86.89

B-15
Eco Glass cleaner 

E12
Case Buckeye 60121400 NO NO 50 $79.88 Buckeye $79.88

Biohazard

C-01
Deodorant-vomit 

absorb
Each YES YES 670 $6.21 $2.69 $3.33

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$2.69

C-02
Mold 

Killer/Treatment
Case YES YES 6 No Bid No Bid

C3 Supplies

D-01 Nutra-Rinse Case Hillyard HIL0071622 NO NO 30
$116.93 - 
HIL0071

522
Hillyard $116.93

D-02
Re-juv-nal Neutral- 
C3 (6-1/2 gal/case)

Case Hillyard HIL0081625 NO NO 150 $79.80
$71.96 - 
HIL0070

522
Hillyard $71.96

D-03
Suprox: C3 (6- 1/2 

gal/case)
Case Hillyard HIL0070422 NO NO 20 $90.04 $74.75 Hillyard $74.75

D-04
Eco Neutral 
Disinfectant

Case Buckeye 60231400 NO NO 60 $79.80 Buckeye $79.80

Carpet Care
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E-01
Double Down 

Trigger HeadEHAR
Each Hillyard HIL26016 NO NO 10

$0.87- Impact - 
Trigger Sprayer - 

400658
$11.30 Hillyard $11.30

E-02
Extraction 
Shampoo

5 Gal YES YES 10 $85.15 $45.45 $89.99
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$45.45

E-03 Defoamer Case/ 1 Gal Hillyard HIL0018304 NO NO 50
$18.82/gal - 
DeFoam - 
54101000

$106.71 - 
HIL0018

306
Hillyard $106.71

E-04 Defoamer Case/ 1Gal YES YES 35 $75.28 $48.79
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$48.79

Enzyme

F-01
Cleaner-Enzyme (1 

Gallon Bottle. 4 
per Case)

Case ENZO-BAC NO NO 65 $84.12 $42.67 Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $42.67

F-02
Liquid Enzyme II (1 

Gallon Bottle. 4 
per Case)

Case Hillyard HIL0047006 NO NO 30 $84.12 $53.48 Hillyard $53.48

F-03 Bacterial Digestant Case Renown REN02814-MS YES YES 10 $42.70
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$42.70

F-04 Drain Maintainer Case Hillyard HIL0112204 YES YES 10 $45.80 $65.54
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$45.80

Floor Care

G-01
Dust Mop 
Treatment

5 Gal United NO NO 36 $58.50 Buckeye $58.50

G-02
HR 2000 - Hillyard 
(1 Gallon Bottle. 4 

per Case)
Case Hillyard HIL0053806 NO NO 20 $69.88- Floortonic - 

51011000 $84.98 Hillyard $84.98

G-03
Top Clean (Bulk 5 

Gal BIB)
Each Hillyard HIL0014407 NO NO 35 $47.77 $36.12 Hillyard $36.12

Floor Care, Gym $5.00

H-01
Pre-Game, (1 

Gallon Bottle. 4 
per case) 

Case Hillyard HIL0045206 NO NO 5 $92.36 $51.97 Hillyard $51.97

H-02 450 Gym Finish 5 Gal Hillyard  HIL0028407 36 $176.47- Coliseum 
450 -  51845000 $281.74 Hillyard $281.74

Floor Care, Gym, Equipment

I-01
Quick Pass Towel 

Only 24" X 72"
Each Hillyard TKH210 NO NO 20 $28.41 Hillyard $28.41

I-02
Hillyard Quick Pass 

6'
Each Hillyard HIL22300 NO NO 1 $486.72 Hillyard $486.72

I-03
Handle Wood 

Lumathread 6 Ft 
Case/12 CSM4526800 NO NO 10 $30.06 Buckeye $30.06

I-04
Screen Disc 13in 

120 Grit 
Case AME501213 NO NO 28 No Bid No Bid

I-05

PAD COMP 
23&30IN FOR 

HIL50108 
MULTIFLOXP

Each Hillyard HIL50162 NO NO 10 $27.04 Hillyard $27.04

Floor Finish

J-01 Endeavour 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0052507 NO NO 300 $81.00 $79.36 Hillyard $79.36

J-02 Explorer 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0053407 NO NO 50 $81 - Clarion 25 
-51315000 $92.15 Hillyard $92.15

Floor Stripper

K-01 Power Strip 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0015007 NO NO 150 $63.62 $43.00 Hillyard $43.00

K-02
RipSaw Floor 

Stripper
5 Gal Buckeye 50255000 NO NO 50 $90.00 Buckeye $90.00

K-03 Juggernaut 5 Gal Buckeye NO NO 15 $122.40 Buckeye $122.40

K-04
Baseboard 

Stripper
Case HIL0113355 NO NO 40 $82.68 $49.76 Hillyard $49.76

Fogger

L-01
Sanitizing Fogger 

Aerosol
Case Hillyard YES YES 210 $58.56 $78.00 $112.94 Hillyard $78.00

General Purpose

M-01 Spray-n-Buff Gal United 534-04 NO NO 25 $21.23 Buckeye $21.23
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M-02  Spray-n-Wipe Gal United 116-04 NO NO 55 $11.85 Buckeye $11.85

M-03
Spitfire, 32oz. 

Power Cleaner and 
Degreaser 

Quart Diversey JWP95891789 NO NO 20 $59.76 $51.75 $3.11 Industrial 
Soap $51.75

M-04 Bleach Gal YES YES 57 $2.49 $1.88 21.58/case $3.49 Industrial 
Soap $1.88

M-05 EXPO Cleaner Gal YES YES 32 $37.80 $23.99 $20.42 Staples $20.42

M-06 Vinegar Gal Heinz PPCO901 YES YES 26 $3.56
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$3.56

M-07 Window Cleaner Gal Boardwalk BWK341-A YES YES 100 $47.16/cs $7.14 $24.90/case Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $24.90

M-08
Aerosol 

Germicidal 
Foaming Cleaner

Case Renown REN05014-AM YES YES 33 $52.68 $39.89
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$39.89

M-09
Aerosol Furniture 

Polish
Case Chase 41-09 Pyramid YES YES 12 $53.64 $44.97 $44.99

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$44.97

Hand Sanitizer 

N-01
Hand Sanitizer 

Foaming
Case Hillyard HIL0041003 NO NO 100 $89.15 $81.42 Hillyard $81.42

N-02
Hand Sanitizer 

Dispensers for N-
01

Case Hillyard NO NO 50 Free of 
Charge Hillyard Free of Charge

N-03
Foaming Hand 

Sanitizer
Case

Appeal foaming 
hand sanitizer

NO NO 4 $89.15 Buckeye $89.15

N-04 Purell, DISPENSER Case NO NO 50 $23.99 Staples $23.99
N-05 Purell ADV Foam Case NO NO 20 $89.15 $58.70 Staples $58.70

N-06
Purell Sanitizer 

8oz bottles
Case NO NO 20 $131.88 $45.59 $42.17 Staples $42.17

Hand Soap

O-01
Soap Industrial 
Cherry Gel 2ltr 

 4/Case HIL0041401 NO NO 12

$70.12- Symmetry 
- Industrial Hand 

Wash 4x2000 ml - 
90181200

$81.25 Hillyard $81.25

O-02
Dispenser Hand 
Defense 2 Liter 

Gray
Each HIL22288 NO NO 5 $10.00 Hillyard $10.00

O-03
Soap, Hand Liquid, 

800ml cart.
Case/12 bwk 8100 YES YES 240 $46.80 $41.89 Nu-Life Labs, 

Inc. $41.89

O-04
Hand Soap 
Dispenser

Case Hillyard NO NO 40 Free of 
Charge Hillyard Free of Charge

O-05 Symmetry soap Case NO NO 60 $48.14 Buckeye $48.14

O-06
Symmetry 
Dispensers

Each NO NO 60 No Bid No Bid

Hand Soap Affinity/Dispensers

P-01

Affinity Citrus 
Fresh 

Antimicrobial 
Foaming Hand 

Soap

Case Affinity HIL0040803 NO NO 200 $70.28 $46.03 Hillyard $46.03

P-02
Affinity Foamy 
Soap Dispenser

Case Affinity HIL22281 NO NO 100 Free of 
Charge Hillyard Free of Charge

Hand Soap GOJO/Dispensers

Q-01
GOJO - Hand 

Cleaner
Each GOJO GOJ728204 YES YES 5 $70.12/cs $84.10 $74.07 Buckeye $70.12

Insecticide

R-01 Insecticide-aero Case Zenex 495785 YES YES 2 $49.99 $57.99
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$49.99

R-02
Insecticide-wasp-

aero
Case Zenex 495975 YES YES 55 $59.09 $63.77

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$59.09

Laundry
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S-01
Laundry Detergent 

Powder
50lb Hillyard HIL00765 NO NO 15

$27.85/50 lb- 
Lagasse - 

DETERGENT, 
LAUNDRY 40LB 

CLEAN AND 
FRESH - 400864

$80.07 Hillyard $80.07

S-02
Laundry Detergent 

Powder
50lb Renown REN05648 YES YES 12 $27.85/50 lb Buckeye $27.85

S-03 Builder Laundry 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0995407 NO NO 10 $96.00 Hillyard $96.00

S-04
Sour 

Laundry/Softener
5 Gal Hillyard HIl0011407 NO NO 10 $126.27 Hillyard $126.27

S-05
Bleach Laundry 

Oxygen
5 Gal Hillyard HIL0913207 NO NO 60 $125.07 Hillyard $125.07

S-06 HS Detergent 5 Gal Hillyard HIL0997007 NO NO 10 $183.66 Hillyard $183.66

S-07
Premium Hand 

Dish Wash Liquid
Gal Hillyard HIL0037306 NO NO 5 $13.28/gal $76.12 Hillyard $76.12

S-08
Detergent Dish 12 
Above met Saf 1 

Gal
Case Hillyard HIL0350306 NO NO 5 $53.12 $141.92 Hillyard $141.92

S-09
Dish Sanitizer H-

129
Case Hillyard HIL0012906 NO NO 5 $63.76 $102.27 Hillyard $102.27

S-10
Rinse Aid Dish 14 

Above 
Gal Hillyard HIL0012906 NO NO 5 $15.94/gal $158.34 Hillyard $158.34

Remover

T-01 Goof Off Each WM Barr FG658 NO NO 62 $5.16 $7.13 Buckeye $5.16

T-02
Muscel Cleaner 

E14
Case Buckeye 60141400 NO NO 20 $90.33 Buckeye $90.33

T-03
Gum Remover - 

Aerosol
Case Chase CH433-4107 YES YES 19 $35.28 - 53650400 $44.99

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$44.99

T-04 Gum-Go , Liquid QT Hillyard HIL0091204 NO NO 12
$5.88/ea- Gum, 

Tar, & Oil Remover  
-53650400

$18.35 38.89/case Hillyard $18.35

Restroom Cleaner

U-01
Light Acid Bowl 

Cleaner
Case of QT Renown REN02835-MS YES YES 20 $50.04 $28.94

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$28.94

Urinal Screens

V-01
Urinal Screens-

Wave 3D
Box Hillyard HIL15014 NO NO 16 $16.50 - Hospeco 

401236 $18.99 $19.21 $19.71 $21.27 Hillyard $19.21

V-02
Urinal Screen 
Wave 3D CUC 
Melon 10/box

Box Fresh Products  NO NO 400 $16.50 - Hospeco 
401244 $18.99 $19.21 $19.71 $21.27

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$18.99

V-03 Urinal screens
Box of 

10/cotton 
blossom

Renown REN03123 YES YES 20 16.50/cs $18.99 Buckeye $16.50

Wipes

W-01
Clorox Disinfecting 

Wipes
Each

CLO15949/BUN159
49

NO NO 10 $26.90 $6.69 $31.92 $0.06 $30.99 $34.13 Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $30.99

W-02 All Purpose Wipes Case Hillyard HIL21411 NO NO 20 $42.35 $23.21 Hillyard $23.21

W-03 Heavy Duty Wipes Case Hillyard HIL21410 NO NO 20

$23.90 - Hospeco - 
TaskBrand Wipers 
Creped Twintote 
150/tote - 400400

$47.90 Hillyard $47.90

Cleaning Equipment

X-01 Jug - 1 qt Each UN BL06 YES YES 20 $0.48
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$0.48

X-02 Caps(for 1 qt) Each CP02 YES YES 20 $0.20
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$0.20

X-03 Trigger Sprayer Each Continental 902rw9 NO NO 20 1.00/ea $0.56
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$0.56

X-04 Pump(for 1 gal) Each Impact 903 YES YES 12 $3.24
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$3.24
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X-05 Pump(for 5 gal) Each RL-PUMP-5 YES YES 15 $5.88
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$5.88

X-06 Sprayer, 2 gal Each RLF1972 YES YES 20 $49.00
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$49.00

X-07
Sprayer, Chem 
Resistant 2 gal

Each RLF1992A YES YES 20 $126.55
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$126.55

X-08
Bucket-Pail-10 qt. 

plastic
Each Continental CO8110GY YES YES 75 $8.79 - Impact 

400562 $10.55

$6.30 - 
Impact 
A7898-
000GY

$14.77 Industrial 
Soap $6.30

X-09 Janitor Cart Each Continental 184BL YES YES 26 $179.37 $129.45
$143.38 - 
Janico - 

1050
$134.67

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$129.45

X-10
Tool Dusting 

Masslinn Orange 
36X5

Each Chix CHI8051 NO NO 5 No Bid No Bid

X-11
Rags, Cotton 

bleached knit rags 
25#

25 lb Bags
K-160 Bleached T-

shirt rags, no collar - 
NOW BXW25C

YES YES 120 $108.74 $39.90 $34.99 Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $34.99

X-12
Microfiber Rag 36 

per bag
Case YES YES 20 $26.26

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$26.26

X-13
Swiffer Duster w/ 
telescopic wand

Box w/ wand 
and 3 refills

Swiffer/Procter 
Gamble

PGC82074 NO NO 20 $66.77 $9.55 $13.89 Industrial 
Soap $9.55

X-14
Swiffer duster 

refills/10
Pack

Swiffer/Procter 
Gamble

PGC21459 NO NO 30 $11.39 $8.48 $10.89 Industrial 
Soap $8.48

X-15
Duster - 

Lambswool
Each Impact 3110 YES YES 100 $3.33 $7.14 $5.25 $5.11 Buckeye $3.33

X-16
Lambswool 

Duster/Telescopic
Each Renown REN05258 YES YES 125 $8.12 $6.99 $6.77 Nu-Life Labs, 

Inc. $6.77

X-17

Trident Microfiber 
Cloth 250GM 
12x12 Yellow 

12/pack

Package Hillyard HIL20031 NO NO 74 $11.94 $6.73 - MC1212YEL230 $8.59 $22.99 Hillyard $8.59

X-18

Trident Microfiber 
Cloth 250GM 

12x12 Blue 
12/pack

Case Hillyard HIL20028 YES YES 50 $179.10 $6.73 - mC1212BLU230 $8.59 $22.99 Hillyard $8.59

X-19

Trident Microfiber 
Cloth 300GM 

16x16 Blue 
12/pack

Package Hillyard HIL20019 YES YES 324 $11.94 $8.76 - MC1616BLU300 $13.37
$6.58 - 
Impact 
LFK500

$14.99 Hillyard $13.37

X-20
Trident Cloth MF 
HD 300GM 16x16 

Red 12/pack
Package Hillyard HIL20020 YES YES 24 $11.94 $8.76 - MC1616RED300 $13.37

$6.58 - 
Impact 
LFK450

$14.99 Hillyard $13.37

X-21
Trident Cloth MF 
HD 300GM 16X16 

green 12 pk
Package   YES YES 24 $11.94 $8.76 $13.37

$6.58 - 
Impact 
LFK300

$14.99 Industrial 
Soap $6.58

X-22
Microfiber Trowel,

11" Pocket MF 
Case YES YES 50 $342.70 Hillyard $342.70

X-23
Microfiber Trowel,
11" VELCRO MF 

Each YES YES 1,000 $4.97
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$4.97

X-24 Brush, toilet Each United OOO17 YES YES 20 $0.89 $3.49 Buckeye $0.89

X-25 Swab Each Impact I-204-100 YES YES 200 $0.63 $0.66 $19.97/per 
Case of 25

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$0.63

X-26
Sponges, Scrub 

3M or sub.
Case Prime Source 4166 YES YES 10 $39.60 $44.70 Buckeye $39.60

X-27
Sponges, scrub, 
3M 74 No SUB

Case 3M 74 NO NO 100 $39.60 $37.90 $42.93 $43.61 $42.64
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$37.90

X-28
Pads, Hand 3M 

green
Case 3M 96 NO NO 20 $31.80 $42.40 $16.28 Staples $16.28

X-29 Magic Erasers PK/4
Procter & 

Gamble
43516 NO NO 55 $4.52 $6.99 $7.43 $3.56 $7.99 $4.44 Industrial 

Soap $3.56
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X-30

Safety Scraper, 
Hand, green 

rubber comfort 
grip

Each Unger SR040 UPC # 76147554166 NO NO 25 $4.25 $4.20 $3.09 $4.79 Industrial 
Soap $3.89

X-31
Safety Scraper, 

Hand
Each YES YES 20 $4.25 $2.66 $3.89

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$2.66

X-32
Safety Scraper 
Replacement 

Blades 
Each Unger

SRBDB UPC # 
761475609005

NO NO 20 $20.27 $12.44 $23.47 $17.91
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$12.44

X-33
Squeegee, 

Complete 10"
EACH Ettore 1165+1330 YES YES 20 $24.16 Buckeye $24.16

X-34
Squeegee, 

Complete 16"
Each Ettore 1177+1330 YES YES 20 $20.88 $16.99 Nu-Life Labs, 

Inc. $16.99

X-35
Window  Cleaning 

Kit
Each Unger PWKOO YES YES 2 $134.53 $97.89 $96.77 Nu-Life Labs, 

Inc. $96.77

X-36

Starmax Webster 
59" Contemporary 

Cob Web Duster 
with Extension 

Handle

Each StarMax
Model# 050-12; 

Global# 
10071626050127

YES YES 10 $8.12 Buckeye $8.12

X-37
WINDOW 

CLEANING KIT
Each Unger UNGCK054 NO NO 8 $159.07 $115.37 $125.67 Industrial 

Soap $115.37

X-38

UNGER 
MICROFIBER 

WASHING PAD 8" 
GREEN 5EA/CS 

PHW20 Refills for 
Window Kit 
UNGCK054 

Each Unger UNGPHW20 NO NO 20 $6.59 $7.89 Industrial 
Soap $6.59

X-39

UNGER 
MICROFIBER 

CLEANING PAD 8" 
GREEN 5EA/CS 

PHL20 Refills for 
Window Kit 
UNGCK054

Each Unger UNGPHL20 NO NO 20 $5.03 $6.29 Industrial 
Soap $5.03

Equipment

Extractor

AB-01
Machine, Floor 

20" 175 rpm
Each Viper VIPVN2015 YES YES 15 $750.00 $583.83 $1,471.61 Industrial 

Soap $583.83

AB-02

Whirlamatic VS 20 
Dust Collector 

Bags (6 per 
package)

Pack Advance 391185 NO YES 10 No Bid No Bid

AB-03
Bag Dust 2000 

Burnisher
Each WIN86215070 YES YES 15 $35.84 Hillyard $35.84

Vacuum & Supplies 0

AD-01
Vacuum, Upright 

SC886
Each Sanitaire 886 YES YES 77 $280.00 $224.40 $188.88 $229.67 Industrial 

Soap $188.88

AD-02
Vacuum Bags, 

SC886 
Case Sanitaire 63262 B NO NO 10 $78.35

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$78.35

AD-03

Vacuum Bags - 
Tornado- CV38 

Vacuum Bags (10 
per pack)

Pack Tornado K69042940 NO YES 50 $8.39 98.89/case Industrial 
Soap $8.39

AD-04
Motor intake Filter 

- Tornado- CV38 
Vacuum Bags

Each Tornado K57316110 NO YES 30 $1.70 Industrial 
Soap $1.70

AD-05
HEPA Filter - 

Tornado- CV38 
Vacuum Bags

Each Tornado K64147600 NO YES 30 $6.55 Industrial 
Soap $6.55

AD-06
NSS PACER V AC 

BAGS (10 PER 
PACK)

PACK GK-P12/15 NO NO 40 $16.08 $11.10 Staples $11.10

AD-07 NSS PACER BELT Each 9697179 NO NO 20 $42.26 Industrial 
Soap $42.26

AD-08
NSS PACER 

FILTERS
Each 9690741 NO NO 40 $11.04 Industrial 

Soap $11.04



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item ACCO Buckeye Clayton Paper & Distribution Inc. Hillyard
Industrial 

Soap
Interboro 

Packaging Corp.
Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Staples Unipak

Vendor Accepted 
Bid

Vendor Accepted $

AD-09

Filter H.E.P.A. 
Twin Pack-

Proteam Super 
Coach Pro

Each ProTeam 107315 NO NO 20 $12.27 $5.11 $17.79 Industrial 
Soap $5.11

AD-10

Replacement 
Extension Cord-
Proteam Super 

Coach Pro

Each ProTeam 101678 NO NO 20 $35.73 $28.02 $48.39 Industrial 
Soap $28.02

AD-11
Vacuum Bags - 

Super Coach Pro 
6qt -10/pkg

Package ProTeam 107314 NO NO 50 $13.67 $11.40 $18.29 Industrial 
Soap $11.40

AD-12 Battery Each Hoover CH17360 NO NO 20 No Bid No Bid
AD-13 CHARGER Each Hoover CH07150 NO NO 20 No Bid No Bid

AD-14

Vacuum Bags - 
Super Coach Pro 
10qt (107303)-10

/pkg 

Package ProTeam 107313 NO NO 50 $18.23 $10.01 $20.61 $11.11 Industrial 
Soap $10.01

AD-15
Vacuum bags-

Hoover Cordless 
back pack  10/pkg

Package YES YES 100 No Bid No Bid

AD-16
Vacuum bags-

HOOVER cordless 
upright 10/pkg

Package YES YES 6 No Bid No Bid

AD-17
HOOVER cordless 

upright belt
Package YES YES 6 No Bid No Bid

AD-18
Hoover Cordless 

upright beater bar 
with brushes

Package YES YES 2 No Bid No Bid

AD-19
Vacuum Bags - 

Super Coach 6qt 
(107314)-10/pkg 

Package ProTeam 107314 NO NO 100 $13.67 $7.98 $17.39 $8.51 Industrial 
Soap $7.98

AD-20 Bags Each Eureka 53354-3 YES YES 25 No Bid No Bid

AD-21 Belts Each Eureka 30563A YES YES 250 $1.44
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$1.44

AD-22 Cords Each Eureka 52370-12 YES YES 30 $29.40
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$29.40

AD-23
Eureka - Sanitaire - 

Beater Bars 12" 
VGII Ball Brg

Each Eureka 53270 NO NO 50 $23.78 $20.28 Industrial 
Soap $20.28

AD-24
Brush Roller for 
windsor Sensor 

XP15
Each  Karcher roller Win5290WI NO NO 50 $32.53 Hillyard $32.53

AD-25 XP15 Vac Bags pack of 10 Renown REN08050 YES YES 50 No Bid No Bid
Vacuum, Wet/Dry 0

AE-01
Wet/Dry Vac 

VL500 55 14 Gal 
(No Substitute)

Each ADVANCE ADV107409093 NO NO 1 $700.00 Buckeye $700.00

Waste Collection 0

AF-01
Mobile Collection 

Equipment
Each Continental 4444-1 YES YES 10 $45.00

$42.27 - 
Janico 
1044GY

$73.89 Industrial 
Soap $42.27

AF-02
Mobile Collection 

Equipment Tilt 
Truck

Each Rubbermaid 1305-73 YES YES 10 $606.00 $979.40 $645.54 $929.59 Buckeye $606.00

Floor Care Equipment & Supplies 0
Brushes/Brooms 0 $6.07

AG-01 Brooms, Angle Each UN OO402-WH YES YES 75 $6.07 $5.98 $13.98
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$5.98

AG-02
Broom, Libman, 
11" path(name 

brand)
Each  YES YES 50 $6.07 Buckeye $6.07

AG-03 Lobby Broom Each GS BRL40B YES YES 12 $6.07 $2.49
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$2.49

Dust Mop-Frame, Handle & Heads 0

AH-01
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 18" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 50 $2.44 $2.25 $4.29 Industrial 
Soap $2.25



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item ACCO Buckeye Clayton Paper & Distribution Inc. Hillyard
Industrial 

Soap
Interboro 

Packaging Corp.
Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Staples Unipak

Vendor Accepted 
Bid

Vendor Accepted $

AH-02
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 18" Quick 
Change

Each HILLYARD HIL52813 YES YES 50 $2.44 $2.69 $3.90
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$2.44

AH-03
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 24" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 50 $3.55 $2.66 $2.81 $4.69
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$2.66

AH-04
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 24" Quick 
Change

Each HILLYARD HIL52815 YES YES 50 $3.55 $2.66 $3.03 $4.15
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$2.66

AH-05
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" x 36" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 50 $4.28 $3.29 $3.59 $6.99
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$3.29

AH-06
Frame, Dust mop 

5" X 36" Quick 
Change

Each HILLYARD HIL52817 YES YES 50 $4.28 $3.29 $3.70 $5.61
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$3.29

AH-07
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" x 60" Quick 
Change

Each YES YES 50 $8.37 $5.22 $7.29 $7.99 $6.49
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$5.22

AH-08
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 60" Quick 
Change

Each HILLYARD HIL52821 YES YES 50 $8.37 $5.22 $6.16 $7.95
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$5.22

AH-09
Handles, Dust 

Mop Quick Change 
60 IN WOOD

Each HILLYARD HIL22608 YES YES 20 $5.87 $7.59 $10.71 $9.99 Buckeye $5.87

AH-10
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 18"

Each HILLYARD HIL53402 YES YES 20 $7.10 $5.29 $5.41 $9.99
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$5.29

AH-11
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 24"

Each HILLYARD HIL53404 YES YES 20 $6.53 $7.13 $11.77
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$6.53

AH-12
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 36"

Each HILLYARD HIL53406 YES YES 20 $9.26 $10.14
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$9.26

AH-13
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE -5" X 60"

Each HILLYARD HIL53409 YES YES 20 $17.09 $153.69
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$17.09

AH-14 Dust Mop Brush Each Rubbermaid  FG634200SILV NO NO 50 $9.44 $4.26 $8.97 $7.30 Industrial 
Soap $4.26

AH-15 Lobby Dust Pan Each Continental C912BK NO YES 12 $17.80 $7.65
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$7.65

AH-16
Executive Lobby 
Broom w/vinyl 

Handle
Each Rubbermaid FG637400BLA NO NO 75 $6.07 $10.44 $11.83 $3.80 $11.49 $7.82 Industrial 

Soap $3.80

AH-17
Lobby Pro Upright 

Dust Pans - 
Rubbermaid

Each Rubbermaid FG253100 BLA NO NO 75 $17.80 $27.77 $26.77 $9.25 $28.97 $20.25 Industrial 
Soap $9.25

Floor Care, Gym 0

AI-01
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Kit
Each Hillyard HIL50043 NO NO 10 $35.40 $50.57 Hillyard $50.57

AI-02
18" Lightweight T-

Bar T Bar Only
Each Hillyard HIL50040 NO NO 3 $35.40 $24.66 Hillyard $24.66

AI-03
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Refill Pads
Each Hillyard HIL50041 NO NO 16 $12.90 $8.71 Hillyard $8.71

AI-04
Multi-flo XP Pad 
Set Kit (1-23" & 1-

30" pad refill)
Each Hillyard HIL50162 NO NO 10 $26.27 Hillyard $26.27

AI-05
Quick Pass Towel 

Only 24" X 72"
Each HILLYARD TKH210 NO NO 6 $28.41 Hillyard $28.41

AI-06
Hillyard Quick Pass 

6'
Each HILLYARD HIL22300 NO NO 2 $472.81 Hillyard $472.81

Wet Mopping Equipment 0

AJ-01
Wringer-Bucket 

Combo Pack
Each Impact I4Y26363Y YES YES 41 $98.74 $96.67 $136.23

$65.14 - 
Janico 
1026YM

$55.99 Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $55.99

AJ-02
Wringer-Bucket 
Combo R-maid

Each RM 7577-88 NO YES 28 $98.74 $165.90 $90.89 $168.97 Industrial 
Soap $90.89

Wet Mopping Equipment, Heads & Supplies 0



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item ACCO Buckeye Clayton Paper & Distribution Inc. Hillyard
Industrial 

Soap
Interboro 

Packaging Corp.
Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Staples Unipak

Vendor Accepted 
Bid

Vendor Accepted $

AK-01

O-Cedar Quick-
Change Mop 
Handle, 60", 

Fiberglass, Yellow 

Each O'Cedar DVOCB965166EA NO NO 50 $10.31 $13.99 Buckeye $10.31

AK-02
Handle Sure Grip 
Wood 1 1/8 Wet 

Mop Each HILLYARD HIL22689 NO NO 20 $11.55 $14.23
Buckeye

$11.55

AK-03

Mop, Fast Track 
Finish Narrow 

Band Head Lrg. 
Blue & White Each Hillyard HIL24013 NO NO 50 $8.47 $6.76 Hillyard $6.76

Doodlebug, Frame & Handle 0

AL-01
Pads, Doodlebug - 
Brown (5/box, 4 

boxes/case)
Case 3M 70071567872 NO NO 12 $22.60 - ETC $29.40 $56.23 $48.97 $42.04

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$29.40

AL-02

Pads, Doodlebug 
Utility Heavy Duty  
- Brown (5/box, 4 

boxes/case)

Case Hillyard HIL29960 NO NO 110 $22.60 - ETC $27.04 $46.97 Hillyard $27.04

AL-03
Pads, Doodlebug - 

White (5/box, 4 
boxes/case)

Case 3M 70071313418 NO YES 20 $25.80 - ETC $33.24 $56.23 $48.97 $42.04
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$33.24

AL-04
Doodlebug, Pad 

Holder 
Case 3M YES YES 50 $55.12 - Impact $19.90 $208.11 $139.99

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$19.90

AL-05
Doodlebug, Pad 
Holder (10 per 

case)
Case 3M 70071312089 NO NO 50 $55.12 - Impact $199.00 $253.86 $139.99 Buckeye $55.12

Floor Pads 0
Round Pads 0

13" 0

AM-01
White Pads 
POLISH - 13"

Case 3M NO NO 50 $11.45 - ETC $14.64 $18.29 $16.45
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$14.64

AM-02
White Pads 
POLISH -13"

Case Not 3M YES YES 50 $11.45 - ETC $12.44

$5.93 - 3M 
Private 
Label 
4100

$8.11 Industrial 
Soap $5.93

AM-03
Red Pad BUFFING - 

13"
Case 3M NO NO 50 $11.45 - ETC $14.64 $17.59 $16.45

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$14.64

AM-04
Red Pad BUFFING - 

13"
Case Not 3M YES YES 50 $11.45 - ETC $12.44

$5.93 - 3M 
Private 
Label 
5100

$8.11 Industrial 
Soap $5.93

AM-05
Black Pads STRIP - 

13"
Case 3M NO NO 50 $11.45 - ETC $14.64 $34.17 $30.05

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$14.64

AM-06
Black Pads STRIP - 

13"
Case Not 3M YES YES 50 $11.45 - ETC $12.44

$5.93 - 3M 
Private 
Label 
7200

$8.11 Industrial 
Soap $5.93

20" 0

AP-01
White Pads 
POLISH - 20"

Case 3M NO NO 120 $22.35 - ETC $26.90 $31.87 $29.49
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$26.90

AP-02
White Pads 
POLISH - 20"

Case Not 3M YES YES 120 $22.35 - ETC $23.60

$11.58 - 
3M Private 

Label 
4100

$14.87 Industrial 
Soap $11.58

AP-03
Red Pad BUFFING - 

20"
Case 3M NO NO 100 $22.35 - ETC $26.90 $31.99 $29.49

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$26.90

AP-04
Red Pad BUFFING - 

20"
Case Not 3M YES YES 100 $22.35 - ETC $23.60

$11.58 - 
3M Private 

Label 
5100

$18.99 Industrial 
Soap $11.58



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item ACCO Buckeye Clayton Paper & Distribution Inc. Hillyard
Industrial 

Soap
Interboro 

Packaging Corp.
Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Staples Unipak

Vendor Accepted 
Bid

Vendor Accepted $

AP-05
Black Pads STRIP - 

20"
Case Amerco - Elite AC400120 NO NO 300 $22.35 - ETC $23.60 $16.59

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$23.60

AP-06
21" Beige - 

Burnisher Pad
Case Hillyard HIL42521 YES YES 30 $24.90

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$24.90

28" 0

AR-01
Twister Green 

Diamond Cleaning 
System

Box/2 435528 YES YES 20 $187.55
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$187.55

Flooring 0

AT-01

Gator Supreme w 
Ultraflex Edge 3 X 

3 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-02

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

5 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-03

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-04

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-05

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 4 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-06

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-07

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

8 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-08

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-09

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 8 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-10

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 8 X 

12 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 10

No Bid No Bid

AT-13
Gator SupremeTile 

19.69 x 19.69 Case MATMTILESSN NO NO 10 No Bid No Bid
Personal Protection Signage & Equipment 0

Signage 0



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item ACCO Buckeye Clayton Paper & Distribution Inc. Hillyard
Industrial 

Soap
Interboro 

Packaging Corp.
Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Staples Unipak

Vendor Accepted 
Bid

Vendor Accepted $

AU-01
Caution Wet Floor 

Sign
Each Impact 9152BH YES YES 10 $7.80 $8.99 $55.46

$7.00 - 
ACS 

M8001

Industrial 
Soap 7.00

AU-02
Caution Wet Floor 

Kit
Each YES YES 12 $7.80 Buckeye $7.80

Personal Protection Equipment/GLOVES 0

AV-01
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx NF201 Small NO NO 20 $122.10 $69.55 $64.70 $48.00/1000 $57.59 $58.00
Interboro 

Packaging 
Corp.

$48.00

AV-02
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx NF202 Medium NO NO 32 $122.10 $69.55 $64.70 $48.00/1000 $57.59 $58.00
Interboro 

Packaging 
Corp.

$48.00

AV-03
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx NF203 LARGE NO NO 55 $122.10 $69.55 $64.70 $48.00/1000 $57.59 $58.00
Interboro 

Packaging 
Corp.

$48.00

AV-04
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx NF204 X-Large NO NO 30 $122.10 $69.55 $64.70 $48.00/1000 $57.59 $58.00
Interboro 

Packaging 
Corp.

$48.00

AV-05
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx GVP9 Small NO YES 52 $46.00 $34.15 $29.45 $29.75/1000 $45.79 $33.00 Industrial 
Soap $29.45

AV-06
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx GVP9 Medium YES YES 77 $46.00 $34.15 $29.45 $29.75/1000 $45.79 $33.00 Industrial 
Soap $29.45

AV-07
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx GVP9 Large YES YES 120 $46.00 $34.15 $29.45 $29.75/1000 $45.79 $33.00 Industrial 
Soap $29.45

AV-08
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx GVP9 X-Large YES YES 120 $34.15 $29.45 $29.75/1000 $45.79 $33.00 Industrial 
Soap $29.45

Toilet Paper/Paper Towels & Dispensers 0
Facial Tissue 0

AW-01

Facial Tissue - 2-
ply; Tissue 

Dimension: 8.2 in 
x 8.4 in and 160 

count

Case YES YES 1 $21.40
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$21.40

Paper Towels & Dispensers 0

AX-01 Towels, Multifold Case General 1508 YES YES 30 $21.46 $18.94
$17.64 - 
Essity 

MB540A
$17.81 Industrial 

Soap
$17.64 - Essity 

MB540A

AX-02 Towels, Singlefold Case General 1507 YES YES 10 $24.96 $18.24
$17.82 - 
Essity 

SK185A
$18.71 Industrial 

Soap
$17.82 - Essity 

SK185A

AX-03
Towels, Paper Roll 

500' +
Case ATLAS 8250 YES YES 400 $25.49 $29.90

$19.35 - 
VonDrehle 

880-N
$20.99 Industrial 

Soap

$19.35 - 
VonDrehle 

880-N

AX-04
Towels, paper Roll 
500+, white towel

Case YES YES 100 $25.49 $25.49
$19.35 - 

VonDrehle 
880-N

$28.99 Industrial 
Soap

$19.35 - 
VonDrehle 

880-N

AX-05
Vondrehle Paper 

Towels; Preserve® 
- 7.9" x 800' 

Case Vondrehle VDC 88O-N NO NO 3,200 $25.49 $18.41 $19.35 $20.89

Hillyard until 
6/30/2022 & 

Industrial 
Soap

$18.41 Hillyard 
& $19.35 

Industrial Soap

AX-06
Brown, hard roll 

paper towel 7.9"x 
800'

Case YES YES 1,450 $25.49 $18.74
$19.35 - 

VonDrehle 
880-N

$20.89
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$18.74

AX-07
Dispenser, roll 

towel, transparent
Each Palmer td021501 YES YES 70 $56.99

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$56.99

AX-08
Vondrehle Paper 
Towel Dispenser

Each Vondrehle VDC8864 NO NO 75 $50.40 $48.22 Industrial 
Soap $48.22

Toilet Tissue & Dispensers 0

AY-01
Jumbo Toilet 
Tissue 2ply

Case JRT 1000 YES YES 800 $26.51 $23.97
$22.66 - 

VonDrehle 
3109

$25.99 Industrial 
Soap $22.66



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
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EST. QTY Per Item ACCO Buckeye Clayton Paper & Distribution Inc. Hillyard
Industrial 

Soap
Interboro 

Packaging Corp.
Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Staples Unipak

Vendor Accepted 
Bid

Vendor Accepted $

AY-02
Jumbo Toilet 
Tissue 2ply

Case Vondrehle VDC1125 NO NO 70 $26.51 $31.69 $32.66 $25.99
Hillyard until 
6/30/2022 & 
Nu-Life Labs 

$31.69 - 
Hillyard & 

$25.99 Nu-Life 
Labs

AY-03
Toilet Tissue 2 ply 

rolls(96 rolls)
Case General 201 NO YES 762 $42.02 $35.55

$36.11 - 
Tork 

TM16165
$40.29

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$35.55

AY-04
Dispenser, TP, 

Double roll
Each Impact 2501 YES YES 20 $13.44 $201.99/case

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$13.44

AY-05
Dispenser, TP, 

Single roll
Each Impact 2500 YES YES 20 $25.44 $109.11/case

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$25.44

AY-06
Jumbo Roll Tissue; 
Preserve® - 3.54" x 

1000'
Case Vondrehle VDC 1209 NO NO 1,200 $26.51 $25.62 $28.77 $33.99

Hillyard until 
6/30/2022 & 

Buckeye 

$25.62 Hillyard 
& Buckeye 

$26.51

AY-07
Twin Jumbo Roll 
Tissue Dispenser

Case Vondrehle VDC 3253 NO NO 100 $18.87 $20.00 Hillyard $18.87

Can Liners 0

AZ-01
Liners, HD 30" x 
36" 8 mic. 10 Gal 

Graphite Black
CS/500 Gateway Liners 400769 YES YES 500 23.60 (.0.047/liner)

$20.59 (90days until 
7/31/22) Then after 7/31/22 

$21.74 (1year)  - 
MR30370MC

$17.34 $25.19 $15.50 Unipak $15.50

AZ-02
Liners, 24" x 33" hi 

density 8 mic.
CS/500 Pitt mr24330N YES YES 350 21.96 (0.022/liner)

$31.24 (90days until 
7/31/22) Then after 7/31/22 

$35.44 (1year)
$15.65 $12.48 $26.99 $21.50 Industrial 

Soap $15.65

AZ-03
Liners, 28" x 43" LL 
6 mil, 23 Gal R-Fit 

Clear
CS/250 Gateway Liners 407594 YES YES 1,200 28.19 (0.113/liner)

$12.80 (90days until 
7/31/22) Then after 7/31/22 
$13.19 (1year) - P4430XC 

$19.34 $26.99 $15.75
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution

$12.80 (90days 
until 7/31/22) 

Then after 
7/31/22 $13.19 

(1year) - 
P4430XC 

AZ-04
Liners, 30"x 37" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/500 Pitt MRS9285MC YES YES 2,050 23.60 (0.047 liner)

$35.94 (90days until 
7/31/22) Then after 7/31/22 

$38.88 (1year) 
$37.08 $34.48 $43.99 $29.95 Buckeye $23.60 (0.047 

liner)

AZ-05
Liners, 40"x48" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/250 Pitt MR40483MK YES YES 1,725 29.81 (0.12 liner)

$30.89 (90days until 
7/31/22) Then after 7/31/22 

$32.41 (1year) 
$30.91 $25.84 $38.91 $25.90

Interboro 
Packaging 

Corp.
$25.84

AZ-06
Liners, 40" x 53" 
1.0 mil, 55 Gal R-

Fit Black
CS/100 Gateway Liner 407144 YES YES 500 29.10 (0.291 liner)

$19.99 (90days until 
7/31/22) Then after 7/31/22 

$21.99 (1year)  - 
EC415412K

$17.82 $23.19 $18.60
Interboro 

Packaging 
Corp.

$17.82

AZ-07
Liners, 40" x 53" 
1.2 mil, 55 Gal R-

Fit Clear
CS/100 Gateway Liner 407279 YES YES 1,240 34.73 (0.347 liner)

$20.44 (90days until 
7/31/22) Then after 7/31/22 
$21.98 (1year) - P5435XC

$26.48 $27.99 $22.25
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution

$20.44 (90days 
until 7/31/22) 

Then after 
7/31/22 $21.98 

(1year) - 
P5435XC

Waste Management 0
Receptacle-Dolly, Container, & Lid 0

BA-01
Waste Receptacle, 

55 gal.
Each Continental 5500GY NO NO 85 $84.50 $49.64

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$49.64

BA-02
Waste Receptacle, 

55 gal. Lid
Each Continental 5501GY YES YES 10 $31.28 $34.90 Buckeye $31.28

BA-03
Waste Receptacle, 

Dolly
Each Continental 3255 YES NO 130 $36.67 $19.44

$25.91 - 
Impact 
7704

$27.59
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$19.44

BA-04
Waste Receptacle, 

25 gal. Square 
Grey

Each Continental CO25GY YES NO 50 $27.14
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$27.14

BA-05
Round Trash Cans 

- 44QT
Each Rubbermaid RCP2947GRA NO NO 50 $23.65 $10.31 $22.89 $61.45 Industrial 

Soap $10.31

Sanitary-Equipment Liners & Supplies 0 0 0

BC-01
Liners, paper 

500/cs
Case Hospeco KL260 YES YES 60 $37.32 (0.03 liner) $16.79 $60.96 $17.50 $23.59 $16.61 Staples $16.61



Bid Sheet - Custodial & Operational Supplies

Key Accepted Bid
Sample Not 

Received
Rejected 
Sample

Sub Not Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item ACCO Buckeye Clayton Paper & Distribution Inc. Hillyard
Industrial 

Soap
Interboro 

Packaging Corp.
Leading Edge Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Staples Unipak

Vendor Accepted 
Bid

Vendor Accepted $

BC-02
Liners, paper 

250/cs
Case Hospeco 6141 YES YES 10 $37.32 (0.03 liner) $14.24 $24.90 $16.63 $19.99 $21.83

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$14.24

BC-03
Waxed Paper 

Liners
Case YES YES 20 $37.32 (0.03 liner) $16.79 $17.50

Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$16.79

BC-04 Sanitary Napkins 8 Case Hospeco MT8 YES YES 1 $99.00
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$99.00

BC-05 Tampons Case Hospeco tampon NO NO 1 $56.88 $82.49
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$56.88

Outdoor Supplies 0

BD-01

American Flag 4' X 
6' heavy duty  
outdoor nylon, 

Embroidered

Each NO YES 66 $51.45
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$51.45

BD-02
Missouri flag 4' X 

6'heavy duty 
outdoor

Each NO YES 44 $44.79
Clayton 
Paper & 

Distribution
$44.79

Laminating Film 0

BE-01
25"x500' Roll, 2 

1/4" Core, 1 
1/2mil 

Roll NO 0 $24.99 Leading 
Edge $24.99

BE-02
25"x500' Roll, 1" 

Core, 1 1/2mil 
Roll NO 256 $22.12 $23.05 Leading 

Edge $23.05

BE-03
27"x500' Roll, 1" 

Core, 1 1/2mil 
Roll NO 188 $27.09 $24.90 $51.31 Leading 

Edge $24.90

BE-04
18"x500' Roll, 2 

1/4" Core, 1 
1/2mil 

Roll NO 0 $17.75 Leading 
Edge $17.75

BE-05
18"x500' Roll, 1" 

Core, 1 1/2mil 
Roll NO 8 $17.93 $16.60 $34.92 Leading 

Edge $16.60

BE-06
25"x500' Roll, 1" 

Core, 3mil 
Roll NO 4 $53.95 Leading 

Edge $53.95

BE-07
27"x250' Roll, 1" 

Core, 3mil 
Roll NO 64 $36.18 $29.15 Leading 

Edge $29.15

BE-08

Cold Laminate, 24"
x300' Roll Dual 

Sided DTP 
Compatible, 5Mil

Roll NO 0 No Bid No Bid


